
TABULATION OF BIDS NAME AND ADDRESS OF BIDDER: Lawn Care by Walter
City of Rockford  Cherry Valley, IL
Grounds Maintenance - Water Sites & Fire Stations
 Bid No.: 221-PW-006  Ø
Bidders Notified:  102

Addendum: x

Item No. Category Total Total Total Total Total Total Total Total

12 Total Mulch Labor (Water Sites) $495.00 $2,023.00 $1,320.00 $870.00 No Bid $1,435.00 $1,100.00 No Bid

26 Total Mulch Labor (Fire Stations) $585.00 $2,380.00 $1,560.00 $1,740.00 No Bid $2,173.00 $1,500.00 No Bid

27 TOTAL "Chocolate" Mulch - All Sites N/C $2,170.00 $425.00 $2,610.00 No Bid $2,112.00 $1,596.00 No Bid

67 Total Spring Clean Up Cost (Water) $2,420.00 $4,700.50 $5,850.00 $3,215.00 No Bid $2,452.50 $2,380.00 No Bid

81 Total Spring Cleanup Cost (Fire Stations) N/C $3,272.50 $1,950.00 $5,075.00 No Bid $1,440.00 $2,780.00 No Bid

121 Total Fall Clean Up Cost (Water) N/C $4,819.50 $5,850.00 $3,215.00 No Bid $4,905.00 $2,380.00 No Bid

135 Total Fall Cleanup Cost (Fire Stations) N/C $3,272.50 $1,950.00 $5,075.00 No Bid $2,880.00 $2,780.00 No Bid

175 Total Cost Per Cut (Water) $64,750.00 $80,325.00 $29,250.00 $63,125.00 $55,000.00 $119,812.50 $54,725.00 $29,825.00

188 Total Cost Per Cut (Fire Stations) $15,250.00 $41,650.00 $9,000.00 $25,875.00 $15,000.00 $48,937.50 $36,600.00 No Bid

191 Total Hourly Services (Water & Fire) $2,250.00 $2,975.00 $500.00 $2,750.00 $1,250.00 $2,250.00 $1,900.00 No Bid

TOTAL BID (WATER ONLY) - Mulch Labor
Costs + Mulch Cost + Spring & Fall
Cleanups All Sites + Mowing All Sites +
Hourly Services

$69,915.00 $97,013.00 $43,195.00 $75,785.00 $56,250.00 $132,967.00 $64,081.00 $29,825.00

TOTAL BID FIRE ONLY) - Mulch Labor
Costs + Mulch Cost + Spring & Fall
Cleanups All Sites + Mowing All Sites +
Hourly Services

$18,085.00 $55,720.00 $15,385.00 $43,125.00 $16,250.00 $59,792.50 $47,156.00 -$

TOTAL BID (WATER & FIRE) - Mulch
Labor Costs + Mulch Cost + Spring &
Fall Cleanups All Sites + Mowing All
Sites + Hourly Services

$88,000.00 $152,733.00 $58,580.00 $118,910.00 $72,500.00 $192,759.50 $111,237.00 $29,825.00

RECOMMEND AWARD Ø

x

RCS Grounds Maintenance
Rockford, IL

x

Reyes Rodriguez Boxcutter LawnCare
Rockford, IL Rockford, IL

x x

CMM
Rockford, IL

x x

Gerke Enterprises
Rockford, IL

x

JJ PARIS                              LCU Properties
Rockford, IL                   Machesney Park, IL


