STATE OF ILLINOIS )
) &S
COUNTY OF WINNEBAGO )

CERTIFICATE OF PUBLICATION IN PAMPHLET FORM

I, the undersigned, do hereby certify that I am the duly qualified and acting Legal
Director and ex officio Keeper of the Records and Seal of the City of Rockford, Winnebago
and Ogle Counties, Illinois (the “City”), and as such official I am the keeper of the official
journal of proceedings, books, records, minutes and files of the City and of the City Council
(the “City Council”) thereof.

I do further certify that on the 20th day of August 2024 there was published in
pamphlet form, by authority of the City Council, a true, correct and complete copy of
Ordinance No. 2024-178-0 and said resolution was so published on said date readily
available for public inspection and distribution, in sufficient number, at my office as Legal
Director and ex officio Keeper of the Records and Seal located in the City.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF I have affixed hereto my official signature and the seal of

the City, this 20th day of August 2024.

‘cﬁ'smﬁ? ﬂ / (,) wa
Sof e 0 %, LEGAL DIRECTOR éND EX OFFICIO
: KEEPER OF THE RECORDS AND SEAL

¥,
¥
£s
-
2
\)

RETIL T
Cir
pamme
Nl "
.IlK
[ . Cla
2 IL
2425853020 808°"



JR:sa Committee report passed: 8/19/24

ORDINANCE NO.  2024-178-0

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ROCKFORD,
ILLINOIS, THAT:

Chapter 105 of the City of Rockford Code of Ordinances, and the 2021
International Fire Code are hereby amended and modified, repealing and replacing any
provision of ordinances, as attached hereto.

The effective date shall be January 1, 2025 for permits submitted on or after
December 31, 2024 with the exception that a new residential, commercial or industrial
construction or addition or remodeling projects may submit under the most immediate
previously adopted codes (ICC 2015 Code Family) or this code until December 31, 2024,

Projects shall be governed by the Code they are submitted, reviewed and permitied under.

The effective date of the 2021 IPMC shall be November 1, 2024.

The provisions and sections of this Ordinance shall be deemed severable,
and the invalidity of any portion of this Ordinance shall not affect the validity of
the remainder.

All orders, resolutions, or ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed
insofar as such conflict exists, and this Ordinance shall take effect immediately upon its
passage, approval and publication, as required by law.

A full, true and complete copy of this Ordinance shall be published within ten

(10) days after passage in pamphlet form by and under authority of the Corporate
Authorities,

APPROVED: Aug. 20 2024

AYOR




AYES: TUNEBERG, FROST, TORINA, WILKINS, HOFFMAN, ROSE, BARRIOS,

BATILEY, BONNE

NAYS:

ABSENT: LOGEMANN, PRUNTY, BEACH, MEEKS, (DURKEE - Away)

ABSTAIN:

ATTESTED:

/] d e

LEGAL DIRECTOR 0

PASSED: 8/19/24 APPROVED: 8/20/24 PUBLISHED: 8/20/24
FILED in my office this _ 20th  day of August , 2024, and published in pamphlet
form this _ 20th  day of August , 2024 by order of the City Council of the

City of Rockford, Tllinois.

7 JC
/ (S ru
Legal Director and ex officio/ |
Keeper of the Records and Seal W,

-
APPROVED BY: b o 7 f J(?l BT N e
Nicholas O. Meyer, Legal Dir }étor

RECOMMENDED BY: \\ %\\\

Jacob L ubm Assistant City Attorney

LTI




International Fire Code

Chapter 9, of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Rockford, lllinois, is hereby amended as follows:
Section 9-111 is amended as foilows:
Section 9-111. Adopted by reference,

The ICC International Fire Code 2021, as recommended and maintained by

the International Code Coundil, Inc, including Appendix A, B, C, D, E, F, G, H, | J, K, L, M and N is hereby
referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this article, with the additions,
insertions, deletions and amendments contained in_section 9-112 and_section 9-113.

Section 9-113 is amended as follows:
Section 9-113 Amendments, additions and deletions.

Amendments to the ICC International Fire Code 2021 have not been set out herein, but can be found on
file with the appropriate department of the city for review and purchase by the public.

Amendments to the International Fire Code.

The ICC International Fire Cade /2021 edition is amended as follows:

(1) Section 101 is amended as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of The City of Rockford, hereinafter
referred to as “this code.”

(2) Section 102,7.1 is amended as follows:

102.7.1 Conflicts. Where conflicts occur between provisions of this code and referenced codes and

standards, the provisions-af-this-code-shallapply; the stricter of the codes and standards shall apply, or
as approved by the fire code official.

(3) Section 103.1 is amended as follows:

103.1 Creation of agency. The BNSERT-NAME-OF-DEPARTMENT] City of Rockford Fire Department is
hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the Fire Code Official. The function of

the agency shall be the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

(4} Section 103.4 is added as follows:

103.4 Restriction of employees. An official or employee connected with the enforcement of this

code, except whose only connectionls that of a memberof the board of appeals established under

City of Rockford Amendments Page 1 of 16 2021 IFC




the provisions of section 111 of this code, shall not be engagedin, or directly or indirectly

connected with, the furnishingof labor, materials or appliances for the construction, alteration

or maintenanceof a building,or the preparation ofconstruction documents thereof, unless that

person is the owner of the building; nor shall such officer or employee engage in any work that

conflicts with official duties or with the interestsof the department.

(55) Section 104.1.2 is added as follows:

104.1.2 Automatic Appeals. In any case where orders or approvals by the Code official and Director of the

Fire prevention Bureau are not in full agreement, the matter shall be resolved in the following manner:

The case shall be reviewed by the Community Development Director and the Fire Chief. If agreement

cannot be reached, the matter shall be referred to the City Administrator for review and decision. The

decision of the City Administrator may then be appealed to the Building Board of Appeals pursuant to
Section 113.

(865) Section 105.5.12 is amended as follows:

105.5.12 Cutting and welding. When required by the fire code official, an operational permit is required

to conduct cutting or welding operations within the jurisdiction.

(7) Section 105.5.16 is amended as follows:

105.5.16 Explosives. An operational permit is required for the manufacture, storage, handling, sale, or
use of any quantity of explosives, explosive materials, fireworks, or pyrotechnic special effects within
the scope of Chapter56. The Fire Code Official, or their designated representative, may immediately
confiscate all explosives, explosive materials, or fireworks upon discovery of violations to this section.

(8#6) Section 105.5.34 is amended as follows:

105.5.34 Open burning. An operational permit is required for the kindling or maintaining of an open fire
or a fire on any public street, alley, road, or other public or commercial ground. Instructions and
stipulations of the permit shall be complied with.

Exception: Recreational fires, as defined in City of Rockford open burning ordinance, which are located

on private residential ground.

(987)Section 105.6.24 deleted and replaced as follows:

105.6.24 Temporary membrane structures, canopies and tents. A construction permit is required
to construct an air-supported temporary membrane structure and tent havingan aggregate area
in excess of 120 square feet. A construction permit is required to construct a canopyhaving an
aggregateareain excess of 400 square feet.

Exceptions:

City of Rockford Amendments Page 2 of 16 2021 IFC



1. Oneday usein conjunction with residential uses unless the tent, canopyreqguires

electrical permit andinspections dueto use of electric equipment.

2. Tents usedexclusively for private recreational purposes.
3. Tentsor canopies usedin conjunctionwith funeral services.
4. Tentsopenon allsides which comply with allof the following:
a. Individualtents shall havea maximumsize of 400 square feet.
b. Theaggregate areaof multiple tents placed side by side without afire break
clearance of not less than 12 feet shall not exceed 700 square feet total.
c. Tents, canopies or membrane structures shall not be located within 20 feet of lot

lines, buildings or other tents or membrane structures, parked vehicles or
combustion engines unless approved by the fire code official.

(1098) Section 109.3 is amended as follows:

109.3 Recordkeeping. A record of periodic inspections, tests, servicing and other operations and
maintenance shall be maintained on the premises or other approved location for not less than 3 years,
or a different period of time where specified in this code or referenced standards. Records shall be
made available for inspection by the Fire Code Official, and a copy of the records shall be provided to
the fire code official on request.

The fire code official is authorized to prescribe the form and format of such recordkeeping. The fire code
official is authorized to require that certain required records be filed with the fire code official.

109.3.1 Records submittal. All required records are to be submitted to the Fire Code Official through an
online submittal process as prescribed by the Fire Code Official.

(1169) Section 109.7 is added as follows:

109.7 Debris as nuisance. Debrisremaining at the scene of afire after the site hasbeen
authorized for removal by the fire department shall constitute a nuisance.Property owner shall be
notified of saidnuisance and,if not rectified to standards established by City of Rockford
inspectors, said debris shall be removed by the city or its dulyauthorized agent. Costs for removal
shall becomealienagainst the property or other actions permitted by law.

(1220) Section 112.4 is deleted and replaced as follows:

112.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply
with anyofthe requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in

City of Rockford Amendments Page 3 of 16 2021 IFC



violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a
permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties within the
limits provided in state and locallaws and punishable by afine of not less than $50.00 and not more
than §750.00 dollars. Each daythat aviolation continues after due notice has beenservedshall be
deemeda separate offense.

(1321) Section307.1 is deleted and replaced as follows:

307.1 General. Openburning shall be prohibited.

Exceptions:
1. As permitted by City of Rockford Open Burning Ordinances

2. Un-incorporated areas with aburnordinance

{1432) Section 307.1.1 is amended as follows:

307.1.1 Prohibited open burning. Open burning shall be prohibited when atmospheric conditions or
local circumstances make such fires hazardous.

(15) Section 307.4.4 is added as follows:

307.4.4 Materials. Fuel for all recreational fires and bonfires shall consist only of seasoned dry
firewood and other material approved by the fire code official. The fire shall be ignited with a
small quantity of paper. The fire shall not be utilized for waste disposal purposes, and the fuel
shall be chosen to minimize the generation of air contaminants.

(1643} Section 308.1.6.3 is amended as follows:

308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns. A person shall not release or cause to be released a untethered-sky lantern or
any other airborne flame producing device.

(1754) Section 308.4.1 is amended as follows:

308.4.1 Group R-2 dormitories. Candles, incense and similar open-flame-producing items shall not be
allowed in sleepingunitsin Group R-2 dormitory occupancies.

(1865) Section 313.2 is amended as follows:

313.2 Group R occupancies. Vehicles gew

compressed-flammable gases-shall not be stored W|th|n—the4m-ng-59aee—e¥ Group R bmldlngs

City of Rockford Amendments Page 4 of 16 2021 1FC



Exception: Areas of Group R buildings designed in accordance with 2021 IBC, or applicable code at the
time of construction, for vehicle storage.

(19#6) Section 506.1.2 is amended as follows:

506.1.2 Key boxes for nonstandardized fire service elevator keys. For new and existing elevators, Kkey
boxes provided for renstandardized-fire service elevator keys shall comply with Section 506.1 and all of
the following:

1. The key box shall be compatible with an existing rapid entry key box system in use in the
jurisdiction and approved by the Fire Code Official.

(204.8%) Section 507.5.3 is amended as follows:

507.5.3 Private fire service mains and water tanks. Private fire service mains and water tanks shall be
periodically inspected, tested and maintained in accordance with NFPA 25, and all other applicable
standards, at the following intervals:

1. Private fire hydrants of all types: Inspection annually and after each operation; flow test and
maintenance annually.

2. Fire service main piping: Inspection of exposed, annually; flow test every 5 years.
3. Fire service main piping strainers: Inspection and maintenance after each use.

Records of inspections, testing and maintenance shall be maintained and a copy submitted to the City
of Rockford Fire Department in accordance with section 109.3.1

(21198) Section 507.5.1.2 is added as follows:

507.5.1.2 Private Fire Hydrants. Where a private fire hydrant water supply is provided from a building
or structure, a room constructed in accordance with 2021 IBC shall be provided with a minimum fire
separation of 2 hours and structurally capable to resist early collapse. Provided rooms shall be accessible
from no less than one exterior door and heated to a minimum of 50 degrees Fahrenheit in accordance
with 2021 International Mechanical Code.

Exception:

1. Buildings provided throughout with an automatic fire suppression sprinkler system shall provide
a room with a minimum fire separation of 1 hour.

2. Separate building or structure provided for the sole purpose of private fire water service
constructed in accordance with this code, 2021 International Building Code, and referenced
NFPA standards

City of Rockford Amendments Page 5 of 16 2021 IFC



(22049) Section 508.1.6 is amended as follows:

508.1.6 Required features. The fire command center shall comply with NFPA 72 and shall contain the
following features:

1 through 3 no changes

4, Annuneiater-Remote elevator control panelurit which allows control of all elevator cars, provides
communication with occupants of all elevator cars, and visually indicateing the location ef-elevaters-and
the operational status of all elevators. whetherthey-are-eperational Annunciatorshall-providecontrel

5 through 18 no changes
(2310) Section 901.4.8 is added as follows:

901.4.8 Fire Alarm Installation Personnel Qualifications. Manual fire alarm, automatic fire detection
systems, and emergency communication systems installation personnel shall be certified to a NICET Fire
Alarm level Il or higher, or an equivalent training program approved by the authority having jurisdiction.
A minimum of one gualified installer shall be on-site during all fire alarm installation activities and final
acceptance test with the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

(24241) Section 901.4.9 is added as follows:

901.4.9 Fire and Life Safety Protection Systems Labels, Tags, and Information Plates: All required
identification labels, tags, and information plates for fire and life safety protection systems shall be
approved and constructed of material designed to resist weathering or loss of required information due
to environmental exposures. All required labels on control valves and system deactivation switches shall
be reflective with lettering contrasting to the background.

(2532) Section 901.6.3.2 is added as follows:

901.6.3.2 Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems Records submittal. All required service and
maintenance records are to be submitted to the fire code official through an enline submittal process as

prescribed by the Fire Code Official.

(2643) Section 901.6.4 is added as follows:

901.6.4 Fire Alarm Service Personnel Qualifications. Manual fire alarm, automatic fire detection

systems, and emergency communication systems inspection, testing, and maintenance personnel shall
be certified in NICET Inspection and Testing of Fire Alarm Systems, or an equivalent training program
approved by the authority having jurisdiction. Qualified personnel shall be on-site during all fire alarm
inspection, testing, and maintenance activities.

City of Rockford Amendments Page 6 of 16 2021 IFC



(275) Section 901.6.56 is added as follows:

901.6.5 Fire Sprinkler Suppression System Installation, Maintenance, and Repair Personnel

Qualifications.

Any individual who performs installation, maintenance, and repair of any fire sprinkler system shall be
employed by a licensed fire sprinkler contractor and meet the minimum qualifications of this section.
except where the individual is exempted by subsection (c).

1. Current certification by a nationally recognized certification organization, such as NICET

certification in Water Based System Layout, at an appropriate level, or the equivalent; on or
after the effective date of this amendment, an appropriate level in NICET certification in
Inspection and Testing of Water Based Systems shall be level I.
2. Current certification by other nationally recognized certification programs approved by the AHJ.
3. An equivalent training program approved by the authority having jurisdiction

(¢) The following are exemptions to the licensing requirements of this Section:

(1) State employees who perform routine inspection or testing on behalf of State institutions and
who meet the requirements of subsection (b) need not be licensed under this Section or employed

by a fire sprinkler contractor under this Act in order to perform routine inspection or testing duties
while engaged in the performance of their official duties.

(2) The requirements of this Section do not apply to individuals performing inspection or testing of
fire sprinkler systems on behalf of a municipality, a county, a fire department, a fire protection
district, or the Office while engaged in the performance of their official duties.

(3) The requirements of this Section do not apply to a stationary engineer, operating engineer, or
other individual employed on a full-time basis by the facility owner or owner's representative
performing weekly and monthly inspections and tests in accordance with applicable standards
adopted under the rules.

{28) Section 901.6.5 is added as follows:

901.6.66 Evidence of Qualification. Life safety and fire protections installation and service personnel
must keep on their person evidence of qualifications while performing their duties. Evidence of
gualification must be presented at the request of the fire code official.

City of Rockford Amendments Page 7 of 16 2021 IFC



1. |If evidence of qualification cannot be produced when requested by the Fire Code Official, the
Fire Code Official may issue a stop work order, issue fines, and require corrective action by the
responsible contractor or property owner.

(29) Section 901.8 is amended as follows:

901.8 Removal of or tampering with equipment. It shall be unlawful for any person to remove, tamper,
or otherwise disturb any fire protection or life safety system required-by-thiscode except for the
purposes of extinguishing fire, training, recharging or making necessary repairs, or where approved by
the fire code official.

(3026) Section 903.2.4.2 is amended as follows:

903.2.4.2 New and existing Group F-1 distilled spirits. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout a building or structure with a Group F-1 fire area used for the manufacture of distilled
spirits.

(312%) Section 903.2.9.3 is amended as follows:

903.2.9.3 New and existing Group S-1 distilled spirits or wine. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout a building or structure with a Group S-1 fire area used for the bulk storage of
distilled spirits or wine.

(3228) Section 903.2.10 is amended as follows:

903.2.10 Group S-2 parking garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist:

Items 1 through 3, no changes

4. Any new or existing parking garages with electric vehicle charging stations.

(3329) Section 903.2.10.3 is added as follows:

903.2.10.3 Parking Garages. New sprinkler systems installed in any parking garage shall be designed to a
minimum hazard classification of Ordinary Hazard 2.

(348) Section 903.3.8.4 is amended as follows:

903.3.8.4 Supervision. Control valves shall not be installed between the water supply and sprinklers
unless the valves are of an approved indicating type that are supervised and secured in the open
position.

City of Rockford Amendments Page 8 of 16 2021 IFC



{35) Section 903.4.3 is amended as follows:

903.4.3 Floor Control Valves. Approved supervised indication control valves shall be provided at the
point of connection to the riser on each floor in buildings greater than three stories above or below

grade plane. high-rise-buildings.

(364) Section 907.2.4 is amended as follows:

907.2.4 Group F. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in accordance
with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group F occupancies where beth any of the following conditions
exist:

1. The Group F occupancy is two or more stories in height with a combined fire area of 12,000 square
feet or greater.

2. The Group F occupancy has a eembined occupant load of 588 100 or more above or below the
lowest level of exit discharge.

3. The Group F occupancy has a combined occupant load of 300 or more.

4. The Group F occupancy is 12,000 square feet or greater and is occupied by more than one tenant.

Exception: Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is equipped throughout with
an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant
notification appliances will activate throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

(372) Section 907.2.9. is amended as follows:

907.2.9. Groups R-2, R-3, and R-4. Fire alarm systems and smoke alarms shall be installed in Group R-2
and R-4 occupancies as required in Sections 907.2.9.1 through 907.2.9.4.32

(382) Section 907.2.9.4.1 is added as follows:

907.2.9.4 Group R-4. Fire alarm systems and automatic smoke detectionalarms shall be installed in
Group R-4 occupancies as required in Sections 907.2.9.4.1 through 907-2.9.4.32.9.4-2,

(394) Section 907.2.9.4.1 is added as follows:

907.2.9.4.1 Manual fire alarm system. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification
system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group R-4 occupancies.

Exceptions:

1. A manual fire alarm system is not required in buildings not more than two stories in height
where all individual sleeping units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces to those units are
separated from each other and public or common areas by not less than 1-hour fire partitions
and each individual sleeping unit has an exit directly to a public way, egress court or yard.

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required throughout the building where all of the following
conditions are met:

2.1. The building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

City of Rockford Amendments Page 9 of 16 2021 IFC



2.2. The notification appliances will activate upon sprinkler water flow.

2.3. A minimum of one manual fire alarm box is installed at an approved location.

(4035) Section 907.2.9.4.2 is added as follows:

907.2.9.4.2 Automatic smoke detection system. An automatic smoke detection system that activates
the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed throughout all interior
corridors serving sleeping units.

Exception: An automatic smoke detection system is not required in buildings that do not have interior
corridors serving sleeping units and where each sleeping unit has a means of egress door opening
directly to an exit or to an exterior exit access that leads directly to an exit.

(41) Section 907.2.9.4.3 is added as follows:

907.2.9.4.3 Group R-3 Boarding, Rooming, and Congregate Living Facilities. A manual fire alarm
system with automatic smoke detection that activates the occupant notification system in accordance
with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group R-3 boarding, rooming, and congregate living facilities.

(4236) Section 907.2.10 is amended as follows:

907.2.10 Group S Self Storage Occupancies. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant
notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group S public- and self-storage
occupancies three two stories or greater in height for interior corridors and interior common areas.
Visible notification appliances are not required within storage units under 1,000 square feet.

Exception: Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is equipped throughout with
an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, and the occupant
notification appliances will activate throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

(4337) Section 907.2.10 deleted and is replaced as follows:

907.2.10.1 Group S. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group S occupancies where any of the following
conditions exist:

1. The Group S occupancy is threefwe or more stories in height.
2. The Group S occupancy has an occupant load of 50120 or more above or below the lowest level of

exit discharge.
3. The Group S occupancy has a combined occupant load of 150289 or more.

4. The Group S occupancy is 12,000 square feet or greater and is occupied by more than one tenant.
Exceptions:

City of Rockford Amendments Page 10 of 16 2021
IFC



1. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant
notlflcauon apphances WI|| activate throughout the notlflcatlon zones upon sprinkler water flow.

(44) Section 907.5.2.3 is amended as follows:

907.5.2.3 Visible Alarms. Visible alarm notification appliances shall be provided in accordance with
Sections 907.5.2.3.1 through 907.5.2.3.3.

Exceptions:

{Exceptions 2-5 remain are renumbered 1-4 and the wording remains unchanged.)

(45) Section 907.6.6 is amended as follows:

907.6.6 Monitoring. New and existing fire alarm systems reguired-by-thischapterorthe
Internationai-Building-Code shall be monitored by an approved supervising station in accordance
with NFPA 72.

{Exceptions remain unchanged)

(46) Section 907.6.2 is amended as follows:

907.6.2 Power Supply. The primary and secondary power supply for the new and existing fire alarm
systems shall be provided in accordance with NFPA 72.

(Exception remains unchanged)

(4738) Section912.2.2 is deleted and replaced as follows:

912.2.2 Existing buildings. On existingbuildings, wherever the fire department

connectionis not visible to approaching fire apparatus, the fire department connection

shallbe indicated by an approved sign mounted on the street front or on the sideof the

building. Such sign shall be reflective and constructed of material designed to resist

weathering. The sign shall have a white background with all lettering and graphics red in

color. Suchsignshall have the letters "FDC" not less than 6 inches (152 mm) high and

words in letters not less than 2 inches (51 mm) high or an arrow to indicate the location

not less than 3 inches {75 mm) high. Such signs shall be subject to the approval of the fire

code official.

City of Rockford Amendments Page 11 of 16 2021
IFC



FDC

XXXX SIDE OF BUILDING

(48395) Section 912.6 is deleted and replaced as follows:

912.6 Backflow protection. A water supply serving a fire suppression system shall be protected against
backflow with a Reduced Pressure Zone (RPZ) backflow device and comply with the requirements of

llinois Plumbing Code.

(490) Section 1103.5.3 is amended as follows:

1103.5.3 Group I-2, Condition 2. In addition to the requirements of Section 1103.5.2, existing building of
Group I-2, Condition 2 occupancy shall be equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. The automatic sprinkler system shall be installed as
established by the-adepting-ordinance{DATE BY WHICH SPRINKLER SYTEM MUSTBEINSTALLED} a
compliance plan submitted by the property owner and approved by the fire code official.

(5041) Section 1103.7.5.2 is amended as follows:

City of Rockford Amendments Page 12 of 16 2021
IFC



1103.7.5.2 Group R-1 and R-3 boarding,-2nd rooming-heuses, and congregate living facilities manual
fire alarm system. A -manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in existing Group R-1 and R-3 boarding,a#€ rooming, and
congregate living facilities.-hoeuses.

Exception:

1. Buildings less than two stories in height where all sleeping units, attics and crawl spaces are
separated by 1-hour fire-resistance-rated construction and each sleeping unit has direct access to
a public way, egress court or yard.

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 and the
occupant notification appliances will activate throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler

water flow.

3. Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box is installed and an approved location.

(5142) Section 1103.7.5.1 is amended as follows:

1103.7.5.1 Group R-1 hotel and motel manual fire alarm system. A manual fire alarm system that
activates the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in existing
Group R-1 hotels and motels more than one story above or below the level of exit discharge or with
more than 28 16 sleeping units.

Exceptions:

1. A manualfire alarm system is not required in buildings less than two stories in height where
all sleeping units, attics and crawl spaces are separated by 1-hour fire-resistance-rated
construction and each sleeping unit has direct access to a public way, egress court or yard.

2. A manualfire alarm system is not required in buildings not more than three stories in height
with not more than 20 sleeping units and equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

3. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required throughout the building where the following
conditions are met:

3.1. The building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

3.2. The notification appliances will activate upon sprinkler water flow.

3.3. Not less than one manual fire alarm box is installed at an approved location.

(5243) Section 1103.7.5.1.1 is amended as follows:

1103.7.5.1.1 Group R-1 hotel and motel automatic smoke detection system. An automatic smoke
detection system that activates the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall

be installed throughout all existing Group R-1 hotels and motels througheutal-interiorcorridorsserving

City of Rockford Amendments Page 13 of 16 2021
IFC



sleeping reoms not equipped with an approved, supervised automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.

Exception: An automatic smoke detection system is not required in buildings that do not have interior
corridors serving sleeping units and where each sleeping unit has a means of egress door opening
directly to an exit or to an exterior exit access that leads directly to an exit.

(5344) Section 1103.7.5.2.1 is amended as follows:

1103.7.5.2.1 Group R-1 and R-3 boarding,2n4d rooming,-heuse and congregate living facilities automatic
smoke detection system. An automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant notification
system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in existing Group R-1 and R-3 boarding,=ar€
rooming, and congregate living facilities-heuses.-througheutal-interiercorridors serving cleepinguaits

car cn
S =

0 o

radyneo i )

YECA T

(5445) Section 1103.7.6 is deleted and replaced as follows:

1103.7.6 Group S A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in existing Group S occupancies where any of the
following conditions exist:

1. The Group S occupancy is two or more stories in height.
2. The Group S occupancy has an occupant load of 100 or more above or below the lowest level of exit

discharge.

3. The Group S occupancy has a combined occupant load of 300 or more.
4. The Group S occupancy is 12,000 square feet or greater and is occupied by more than one tenant.

Exceptions:

1. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is equipped throughout with an
gutomatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant
notification appliances will activate throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

2. Visible notification appliances are not required to be installed within individual storage units
under 1,000 square feet.

(5546) Section 1103.7.7 is added as follows:

1103.7.7 Group F. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in existing Group F occupancies where any of the
following conditions exist:

1. The Group F occupancy is two or more stories in height with a combined fire area of 12,000 square

feet or greater.
2. The Group F occupancy has an occupant load of 100 or more above or below the lowest level of exit
discharge.
3. The Group F occupancy has a combined occupant load of 300 or more.
4. The Group F occupancy is 12,000 square feet or greater and is occupied by more than one tenant.

City of Rockford Amendments Page 14 of 16 2021
IFC



Exception: Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is equipped throughout with
an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant

notification appliances will activate throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

(56) Section 3303.5 is amended as follows:

3303.5 Fire safety requirements for building of Types IM-A\-B,\-C IV and V construction. Buildings
of Types M-ANB I/ C |V and V construction designed to be greater than six four stories above grade
plane shall comply with the following requirements during construction unless otherwise approved by
the fire code official.

(Remainder of the section is unchanged)

(5747) Section 3305.5.1 is amended as follows:

3305.5.1 Fire watch during construction. A fire watch shall be provided during nonworking hours for new
construction that exceeds 40 feet (12 192 mm) in height above the lowest adjacent grade at any point

along the building perimeter, for new multistory construction with-an-aggregate area-exceeding50;000
sq-&a#e—feet—(—él-éa%—mg)—aer—s%epy or as required by the fire code official.

{5848) Section 3305.5.2.1 is amended as follows:

3305.5.2.1 Duties. The primary sole duty of fire watch personnel shall be to perform constant patrols
and watch for the occurrence of fire. The combination of fire watch duties and site security duties is
acceptable.

(5949) Section 3305.5.2.2 is amended as follows

3305.5.2.2 Training. Personnel shall be trained to serve as an on-site fire watch. Training shall include the
use of portable fire extinguishers, use of on-site fire protection systems, and response to fire, medical,
and weather emergencies. Fire extinguishers and fire reporting shall be in accordance with Section 3310.
Documentation of training for fire watch personnel shall be made available to the fire code official upon

reguest.

(60) Section 3305.9 is amended as follows:

3305.9 Separations hetween construction areas. Separations used in Fypeltand FyoeHconstructien to
separate areas from occupied portions of the building shall be constructed of materials that comply with
one of the following:

(remainder of the section is unchanged)

(6158) Section5601.2.2 is deleted and replaced as follows:

City of Rockford Amendments Page 15 of 16 2021
IFC



5601.2.2 Sale and retail display. Persons shall not construct a retail display nor offer for sale
explosives, explosive materials, or fireworks (1.3G or 1.4G). The Fire Code Official, or their designated
representative, shall confiscate all explosives, explosive materials, or fireworks related to the violation of

this section.

{625%) Section 5608.1 isamended as follows:

5608.1 General. Outdoor fireworks displays, use of pyrotechnics before a-preximate an audience,
and pyrotechnic special effects in motion picture, television, theatrical, and group entertainments
productions shall comply with Section 5608.2 through 5608.10, NFPA 1123 and 1126, and all
governing federal, state, and local laws and ordinances.

City of Rockford Amendments Page 16 of 16 2021
IFC



